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By JULIE MACK
Kalamazoo Gazette

KALAMAZOO — Kal-
amazoo County’s nine 
school districts are launch-
ing a new program in which 
students can earn a degree 
or certificate from Kalama-
zoo Valley Community Col-
lege during a “13th grade” 
in high school.

Known as Early/Middle 
College, tuition and fees 
will be paid by school dis-
tricts, which will collect the 
state’s per-pupil foundation 
allowance for those stu-
dents, school superinten-
dents told the Kalamazoo 
Gazette (http://bit.
ly/1slTeR7 ).

The Schoolcraft and Gull 
Lake school districts are pi-
loting the program this 
school year. It is tentatively 
scheduled for implementa-
tion in fall 2015 at the other 
seven districts – Kalama-
zoo, Portage, Vicksburg, 
Comstock, Parchment, 
Galesburg-Augusta and 
Climax-Scotts – pending 
approval of the individual 
school boards, which is cur-
rently under way.

“Since college education 
is more important and more 
expensive than ever, we be-
lieve this will be a potential-
ly powerful option for stu-
dents,” said David 
Campbell, superintendent 
of the Kalamazoo Regional 
Educational Service Agen-
cy.

In essence, the superin-
tendents said, the Early/
Middle College program is 
an expansion of dual en-
rollment, the program that 
allows Michigan high 
school students to take col-
lege classes for free. It also 
builds on Kalamazoo 
County’s Education for 
Employment and Educa-
tion for the Arts, which of-
fer career and technical ed-
ucation classes.

The big difference from 
dual enrollment and EFE/
EFA: Rather than take ran-
dom classes for college 
credit, Early/Middle Col-
lege students will focus on a 
specific program of study. 
Also, they will delay high 
school graduation for a 
year, and they will use that 
fifth year of high school to 
potentially earn an associ-
ate’s degree or vocational 
certificate from KVCC.

While it will take those 
students five years to gradu-
ate high school, once they 
do, they’ll be ready to either 
enter the workforce in a 
skilled trade or transfer to a 
four-year college as a ju-
nior.

Early/Middle College ini-
tially will offer seven pro-
grams of study: An associ-
ate’s degree for students 
transferring to a four-year 
college; an associate’s de-
gree in graphic design or 
machine-tool technology; a 
certificate in graphic design 
or machine-tool technolo-
gy, and a certificate of com-
pletion to be a welder or 
personal computer support 
technician.

The programs for weld-
ers, machinists, computer 
technicians and graphic de-
signers were chosen based 
on local job demand, school 
officials said.

“Local manufacturers 
and businesses are very in-
terested in this,” said Deb 
Miller, who oversees EFE. 
“We’re keeping them in the 
loop.”

Carrie Pickett-Erway, 
president/CEO of the Kala-
mazoo Community Foun-
dation, said she and others 
see Early/Middle College as 
a critical part of efforts to 
create a “cradle-to-career” 
education system in Kala-
mazoo County.

“This is a big moment for 
the community,” Pickett-
Erway said. “It’s very excit-
ing.”

The program “is a direct 
path from high school to 
college to jobs in high de-
mand,” Pickett-Erway said.

It’s also a big deal for stu-
dents who want to earn a 
four-year degree, she said.

Campbell and Pickett-

Erway said local officials 
have talked for years about 
having an Early/Middle 
College here.

EMC “is something many 
people have been trying to 
bring to life for almost 10 
years, but it’s always gotten 
stalled at different points 
because of funding or infra-
structure issues,” she said.

What made a difference 
this time: The Learning 
Network of Greater Kala-
mazoo, which is operated 
through the Kalamazoo 
Community Foundation, 
kicked in $150,000 for the 
planning process, and 
KVCC, KRESA and the 
Lumina Foundation also 
offered support.

That paid for people to 
work on putting the neces-
sary pieces in place. The 
main point person has been 
Jim Murphy, who works for 
KRESA.

A big part of the process 
is coordinating among nine 
school districts with differ-
ent ideas of how EMC 
would best work in their 
district, as well as working 
with KVCC and the EFE/
EFA programs.

“It’s a difficult thing to 
get off the ground,” Camp-
bell said.

He said the program is 
being “customized” and 
will operate a little differ-
ently in each high school.

But in general, most stu-
dents will enter the Early/
Middle College program as 
a sophomore by taking a 
college success strategies 
course at their home high 
school.

That course, which is re-
quired for entrance into 
EMC, will teach the study 
skills that students need for 
college-level classes – such 
as how to take notes and 
study effectively for a test.

EMC students would 
then take dual-enrollment 
classes at KVCC or specific 
courses that offer college 
credit through EFE and 
EFA during their junior 
and senior year, school offi-
cials said.

The students’ fifth year of 
high school would be main-
ly spent at KVCC finishing 
up their college program of 
study, although students 
could take classes such at 
their home high school, 
such as band or choir.

While they are taking col-
lege classes, students must 
participate in “seminar” – a 
regular meeting of EMC 
students to talk about their 
experiences and share tips 
and resources. Each EMC 
student also will be assigned 
a mentor, who will help 
oversee their progress.

The college strategies 
class, seminar meetings 
and mentors are consid-
ered key to helping teenag-
ers make the transition to 
higher education and stay 
on track.

Students can enter the 
EMC program after sopho-
more year, but they are still 
required to take the college 
strategies class first and may 
not be able to finish the col-
lege program by the end of 
their fifth year of high 
school.

The associate’s degree 
programs require students 
to earn 62 credit hours, 
which is equivalent to four 
or five full-time semesters. 
The certificate programs 
run between 10 and 32 
hours.

5-year program 
offers degrees to 
high schoolers

By E. EDUARDO CASTILLO 
and CHRISTINE ARMARIO
Associated Press

HAVANA — Daniela 
Martinez long figured that 
someday she would leave 
the struggles of daily life in 
Cuba and join her uncle in 
the United States, but after 
the events of the last few 
days, the 18-year-old medi-
cal student thinks exile may 
not be her only choice.

“He always tells me 
things are better there,” 
Martinez said, gesturing 
with her chin toward the 
sea leading to Florida. 
Dangling her legs over the 
edge of the Malecon, the 
iconic concrete seawall 
where entertainment-
starved young Havanans 
gather each evening, she 
said, “I think things are go-
ing to get better.”

For a generation that 
grew up believing the best 
way to pursue their dreams 
was to leave the island, the 
announcement this week 
that Cuba will open rela-
tions with the United States 
is prompting many to re-
evaluate their futures. At 
the same time, Cuban-
Americans are considering 
what the changes will mean 
for their lives, with some 
even wondering whether 
they are significant enough 
to present a once far-
fetched chance for them to 
return.

The five decades of es-
trangement since Fidel 
Castro came to power in 
the Cuban revolution have 
created an economic and 
psychological gulf much 
wider than the 90 miles of 
the Florida Straits. But the 
opening of relations, with 
increased travel and com-
munication, stands to nar-
row those differences and 
create new opportunities, 
especially for young people 
less burdened by the past.

For Cubans like Marti-
nez, it may mean that be-
coming a doctor won’t limit 
her to a meager state salary. 
For others, there is the hope 
of Internet access and an 
end to the desperation that 
leads thousands to migrate 
each year. Cuban-Ameri-
cans, meanwhile, see the 
possibility of starting busi-
nesses in their homeland, 
connecting with their roots 

and putting aside the bit-
terness of parents and 
grandparents who were ar-
rested, exiled or had prop-
erty seized in the revolu-
tion.

“My family always said 
they weren’t going back 
until Fidel died,” said Van-
essa Garcia, a 35-year-old 
writer in Miami whose par-
ents left Cuba in the 1960s. 
“But it seemed like that was 
something that was hurting 
us rather than helping us in 
many ways. It’s lasted much 
longer than anybody 
thought it would.”

Some change already has 
been in the works. Cuba 
did away with a longstand-
ing restriction on overseas 
travel last year, and knowl-
edge of modern culture has 
been making its way into 
the island via TV and flash 
drives brought from over-
seas – enough for people 
here to know what they are 
missing. Young people in-
creasingly are on Face-
book, even if  they don’t 
manage to get online often. 
And in the other direction, 
Cuban-Americans have 
been visiting in greater 
numbers, often helping to 
keep their extended fami-
lies afloat. 

Many in Florida grew up 
hearing their grandparents’ 
stories about fleeing from 
communism. The revolu-
tion, they were taught, 
brought an end to freedom 
and ushered in tyranny. 
Cubans on the island, 
meanwhile, learned from 
state propaganda that the 
Yankees were the enemy 
and capitalism was savage. 
Anybody who left was 
called a “worm.”

But Cubans and Cuban-
Americans find that when 
they meet, they have much 
more in common than ex-
pected. They share the 
same hand gestures, slang 
and even taste in music. 
They love baseball with a 
passion. “Everybody says 
their grandmother’s flan is 
the best and nobody knows 

how to make a Cuban 
sandwich except the place 
that they know,” said Dave 
Sandoval, a musician in 
Washington.

Even after years of pro-
paganda, Cubans are fasci-
nated with some of the 
most hyper-American as-
pects of U.S. culture. Paula 
Pineiro, a 14-year-old high 
school student and musi-
cian, is dying to see the sky-
scrapers of New York while 
classmate Otto Rivero 
wants to see Disneyland 
and Las Vegas, places he 
knows only from TV.

“We want to have new 
experiences,” says the 
14-year-old Rivero. “I love 
casinos. They say they are 
magnificent.”

Yusset Perez, 30, arrived 
in Miami 10 months ago to 
join his wife and found 
work at a college as an ad-
ministrative assistant and 
computer lab manager. But 
now he’s thinking about 
opening a business back 
home. 

“I always wanted to 
maintain ties, not turn my 
back from Cuba entirely,” 
Perez said in Hialeah, the 
heavily Cuban Miami 
neighborhood where he 
passed out flyers for the 
college in front of a dis-
count store specializing in 
clothing and housewares 
destined to be sent back to 
the island.

Nearly everyone in Cuba 
seems to have some famil-
ial connection to the Unit-
ed States, though people 
from the two countries can 
have cartoonish views of 
each other. 

Many Cubans are envi-
ous of the lifestyle and 
wealth of their relatives in 
the U.S., but can also con-
sider them materialistic 
and arrogant. Many feel 
Americans don’t respect 
their accomplishments, 
such as in schools and 
medical care. 

Beatriz Garcia, a 25-year-
old who teaches Spanish to 
foreign students, said that 

while she hopes to see Cuba 
have greater access to af-
fordable consumer goods, 
she bristled at the notion 
the U.S. is better. “Over 
there, they may have a bet-
ter economy,” she said, 
“but here we have good 
education and health.”

Cuban-Americans, on 
the other hand, sometimes 
see islanders as poor and 
unsophisticated, out of 
step with the modern 
world.

“It definitely feels like a 
frozen 1950s version of ev-
erything my grandparents 
told me it looked like,” said 
Garcia, the writer.

Miami architect Jovan 
Rodriguez said he’s noticed 
improvements in Cuba, 
such as when he visited in 
February and found that a 
relative’s home was for sale 
– something only made 
possible by recent property 
reforms. It’s still not legal 
for foreign nonresidents to 
buy real estate, but he’s 
hopeful that may become 
possible. 

“This completely 
changed my whole outlook 
toward the future as far as 
my relationship with 
Cuba,” Rodriguez said. “I 
really made a profound 
connection with the people. 
I really hope to be able to 
go back soon, and I hope 
relations between our two 
nations make it easier for 
that to happen.” 

At the University of Ha-
vana, several students said 
they are aware of problems 
in their country but are op-
timistic about the future. 

Sitting on the same steps 
where Fidel Castro ad-
dressed jubilant crowds af-
ter rolling into Havana in 
January 1959, Ernesto 
Gutierrez Leyva, 20, said 
he would like to see Cuba 
move toward greater politi-
cal tolerance, perhaps even 
a multiparty system, an 
idea that is still officially 
considered anathema. The 
country “is broken, but you 
have to fix it from here,” he 
said. 

And on the Malecon, 
Martinez noted there are 
advantages to staying in 
Cuba, such as a free univer-
sity education.

“I want to go to see it,” 
she said of the United 
States, “but live in Cuba.”

A chance to breach divide 
for young in Cuba and US

Ramon Espinosa / AP

Youths sing and play music as they hang out in a park in Havana, Cuba, on Friday. For a generation that grew up believing the 
best way to pursue their dreams was to leave the island, the announcement this week that Cuba will open relations with the U.S. 
is prompting many to re-evaluate their futures. Also, Cuban-Americans are considering what the changes will mean for their 
lives, whether they are significant enough to present a once far-fetched chance for them to return.

This completely changed my whole outlook 
toward the future as far as my relationship 
with Cuba. ... I really made a profound con-
nection with the people.

JOVAN RODRIGUEZ
Miami architect
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