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LOCAL & STATE
ST. JOSEPH — Cor-

nerstone Alliance unveiled 
its fi ve-year strategic plan 
Thursday o its investors 
and other stakeholders at 
the Celebrating Corner-
stone Alliance Investor 
event at the Inn at Harbor 
Shores.

The 2017-21 Cornerstone 
Alliance Strategic Plan is 
focused on business attrac-
tion, expansion and small 
business enterprise, while 
engaging the support of the 
community.

Cornerstone Alliance 
President Rob Cleveland 
addressed the more than 
150 investors, community 
stakeholders and economic 
development partners, de-
tailing how the economic 
development organization 
will use the plan to guide 
its work over the next fi ve 
years and beyond.

“There are so many won-
derful things happening in 
Berrien County,” Cleve-
land said. “We have strong, 
growing companies that are 
recruiting new, diverse tal-
ent to our region. We have 

world-class events like the 
KitchenAid Senior PGA 
Championship that bring 
new visitors to our great 
community. The strategic 
plan will leverage these as-
sets to strengthen economic 
opportunities in Michigan’s 
Great Southwest.”

The four centerpieces of 
the Cornerstone Alliance 
2017-2021 Strategic Plan 
are:
• Changing our econom-

ic future
• Enhancing our assets
• Sharing our secret with 

the world

• Investing in Berrien 
County’s next chapter

According to Cleveland, 
economic development is 
as competitive as it has ever 
been. Cornerstone Alliance 
is one of 23,000 economic 
development organizations 
throughout the country 
selling its regional business 
assets to companies, real 
estate advisors and site con-
sultants.

“It is the responsibility of 
Cornerstone Alliance to do 
the work needed to make 
Berrien County a top con-
tender for new jobs and 

investments, providing new 
opportunities for our chil-
dren, neighbors and friends 
– not only for the next fi ve 
years, but for generations to 
come,” Cleveland said.

The timing of the plan is 
relevant, as Berrien County 
was recently ranked as one 
of the “Top 15 leading loca-
tions in the United States” 
for new and expanding 
businesses by Area Devel-
opment Magazine.

For the last six years, 
the publication has studied 
and ranked more than 385 
regions across the country, 

using four signifi cant crite-
ria: Prime workforce; eco-
nomic strength; year-over-
year growth and fi ve-year 
growth.

“We couldn’t be better 
positioned to deliver posi-
tive economic develop-
ment outcomes to Berrien 
County,” Cleveland said. 
“This ranking proves that 
Berrien County is viewed 
by the site selection experts 
as a leading venue for new 
and expanding industry 
and is an ideal place for a 
business to locate and be 
successful.”
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Cornerstone Alliance reveals 5-year plan
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Berrien County Sheriff Deputy Doug Heminger, Capt. JoAnn Ertman, and Sgt. Tom Fogarty Jr., from left, show off bags of 
donated winter clothing that will be distributed to area children in need as part of the Berrien County Sheriff’s Department 
Mounted Division’s coat drive. Sheriff Paul Bailey’s Mounted Division joined Coloma Police Lodge 147 and area businesses 
including, Family Farm and Home, Wal-Mart, Meijer, Target and the AT&T Pioneer Club in collecting more than 200 winter 
items including hats, mittens, coats and scarves.
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BENTON HARBOR 
—  A top-ranked profes-
sional services fi rm from 
Berkeley, Mich., is Lake 
Michigan College’s choice 
to oversee the renovations 
of its main campus at Na-
pier Avenue.

LMC trustees  unani-
mously agreed to hire Stan-
tec for the job, and then ne-
gotiate a contract with the 
fi rm for construction man-
agement and design work, 
said Anne Erdman, LMC’s 
vice president of adminis-
trative services.

“We’re estimating a year 
for the design because the 
project is very complex. 
We think that construction 
would go through 2019,” 
Erdman said. “It has to be 
done right. We think the 
programming at the begin-
ning is what makes a proj-
ect, and so do they. That’s 
where we’re going to spend 
our time.”

President Emeritus/Act-
ing CEO Bob Harrison said 
he expects Stantec to start 
preliminary design work 
in January, once both sides 
work out a contract and the 
board signs off on it.

“We’ll start the negotia-
tions with them, clearly de-
fi ne the expected outcomes, 
and negotiate the price. 
Then we’ll start to craft out 
what the scope of work it 
will be. It’s very exciting,” 
he said.

Stantec emerged as the 
top contender after buying 
out Duce Simmons, which 
had done similar work for 
LMC, Erdman told the 
board Tuesday.

Stantec is also the top-
ranked architectural fi rm 
among 300 in its fi eld na-
tionwide – “so this will be a 
known quantity that we’re 
recommending to you,” she 
said.

LMC received an $8.5 
million capital outlay grant 
from the state, which will 
allow the college to make 
numerous improvements at 
Napier Avenue.

The college had to match 
the grant amount.

Key aspects include the 
renovation of 50 class-
rooms and two lecture 
halls; collaborative learning 
spaces; and the creation of 

a Career and Transfer Cen-
ter, and Student Success 
Center.

LMC plans to issue $10 
million in  bonds by next 
spring to help cover the 
construction costs of the 
Napier Avenue project and 
its long-planned Wine and 
Culinary Center, Harrison 
said.

In anticipation of that 
step, the board passed a 
resolution to allow LMC 
to recover costs associated 
with both projects, Harri-
son said.

“We’ll be able to start 
spending some of the bond 
proceeds for those costs. It’s 
pretty standard in public 
construction, where a pub-
lic body will pass a resolu-
tion of this type,” he said.

In another matter, the 
board adopted a policy re-
quiring LMC’s president to 
live within 20 miles of the 
college’s nearest boundary 
– and do so within 60 days 
of hiring.

LMC is searching for a 
permanent successor to 
Harrison, who returned in 
his current position in May 
after the board fi red Jenni-
fer Spielvogel.

The board decided to 
make those expectations 
offi cial after discovering 
– during the search – that 
it didn’t have a residency 
policy, board Chairwoman 
Mary Jo Tomasini said.

“It’s the board’s desire 
that any future leader of 
this college would live in the 
district, as they have (done) 
in the past,” she said.

“I think it’s a really good 
idea, to get it in writing. 
It takes away that ques-
tion,” board Treasurer Judy 
Truesdell said before the 
vote.

The board accepted its 
audit from Rehmann Rob-
son, which came back with 
a clean opinion – meaning, 
no weaknesses or recom-
mendations – for the fi scal 
year ending June 30, 2016.

Rehmann found no ma-
terial weaknesses in LMC’s 
grants and fi nancial state-
ments, which showed “an-
other strong fi nancial op-
erating performance for the 
college – with assets of $90 
million, liabilities of $42.8 
million, and a net position 
of $45 million,” the  report 
stated.

By RALPH HEIBUTZKI
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LMC prepared 
to hire project 
oversight team

NEW BUFFALO — 
Dennis Durham was New 
Buffalo City Council’s 
choice for city manager 
out of  three candidates 
considered during a two-
hour meeting Friday.

Durham has been  city 
manager of  Parchment, 
Mich., a city of  about 
1,800 in Kalamazoo 

C o u n t y , 
since 2007. 
He  has 22 
years of  ex-
perience in 
city man-
agement, 21 
of  them in 
southwest -
ern Michi-

gan. This, and his strong 
emphasis on communica-
tions, economic develop-
ment ,project manage-
ment and above-average 
job tenure were the main 
attributes mentioned by 
council members.

The council voted 
unanimously to offer him 
a two-year contract with 

a salary not to exceed 
$85,000, pending a back-
ground check. The offer 
is subject to salary nego-
tiations and includes two-
month severance if  termi-
nation occurs.

As Parchment city 
manager Durham has su-
pervised  19 full-time and 
six part-time employees, 
and a $2.6 million budget. 
While there, he oversaw 
the redevelopment of  a 
85-acre former paper mill 
property and the reorga-
nization of  its fi nancial 
management system.

He was Kalamazoo’s as-
sistant city manager/chief  
of  staff  from September 

2002 to November 2003, 
and assistant city man-
ager of  Portage from Oc-
tober 1996 to September 
2001, after serving as as-
sistant to the city manager 
for one year. He was also 
administrative assistant/
graphics technician for the 
city of  Littleton, Col.

Durham received his 
bachelor’s degree in jour-
nalism in   1991 from 
Michigan State Universi-
ty. Since 2005, he has also 
been the owner/general 
partner of  CivicQuest, 
specializing in government 
and community organi-
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Durham has 22 
years’ experience 
in government

New Buffalo picks new city manager

DURHAM

The Berrien County 
Sheriff’s Offi ce Reserve 
Division held their annual 
“Shop with a Cop” pro-
gram Saturday at the Niles 
area Wal-Mart, helping 11 
families and 40 children  to 
shop for Christmas gifts 
for themselves, their family 
members, and their friends.

This year, the Reserve 
Division partnered with 
the Berrien County Sher-
iff’s Offi ce Chaplains, the 
Berrien Springs-Oronoko 
Township Police Depart-
ment, the Fraternal Order 
of Police Explorers Pro-
gram, the Berrien County 
Sheriff’s Offi ce Sworn Dep-
uties, and the Saint Joseph 
City Department of Public 
Safety.

This is the by far the most 
families and children that 
the Berrien County Sher-
iff’s Offi ce Reserve Division 
has adopted in the years 
they have been providing 
assistance to the communi-
ty through the “Shop with a 
Cop” program.

The families and children 
were from Watervliet, Niles 
, Berrien Springs, and Eau 
Claire. All the families were 

provided with food baskets.
Following the shopping, 

the Reserve deputies and 
members of the partner 
agencies and organizations 
took the children and their 
families to Michiana Chris-
tian Embassy in Niles for 
lunch and gift wrapping 
with Mrs. Claus and mem-
bers of Michiana Christian 
Embassy.

The recipients  were re-

ferred to the Berrien Coun-
ty sheriff’s offi ce by schools 
and civic organizations, 
which felt they could use 
the assistance this year.

Business and organiza-
tion assisting in the ef-
fort include:  Friends for 
Berrien Springs; Camp-
bell Ford Lincoln Saleen; 
D.A. Dodd; Pike Funeral 
Home; Michigan CAT; 
Chemical Bank; Michi-

ana Recycling; Midwest 
Waste; PNC Bank; A-1 
Road Service; Michigan 
Tops 521; Southeast Ber-
rien County Landfi ll; AIS 
Construction Equipment; 
Jeremy Vandermeulen; 
The Studio Salon; Niles 
area Wal-Mart; Subway 
Restaurants; Milano’s 
Pizza; Michiana Christian 
Embassy; Independent Re-
cycling; Pam’s Signs.

By HP STAFF

Berrien County Sheriff’s Dept. holds Shop with a Cop program

Judges to judge 
Shoreham lights

Berrien County Judges 
Arthur Cotter and Charles 
LaSata will be the guest 
judges for the Shoreham 
Village holiday lights con-
test, beginning at 6 p.m. 
Tuesday.

The judges will view 
around 400 homes and 
then return to the Village 
Hall to decide the most cre-
ative, most fun and decora-
tive houses in the commu-

nity of 862 residents. The 
winning homes will have 
signs placed in their yards 
designating fi rst, second 
and third-place awards.

Visitors can view the 
homes during the holiday 

season. The contest is orga-
nized by the Village of Shore-
ham Events Committee.

Home invasion 
investigated

An armed home inva-
sion that occurred Friday 
in Sodus Township is be-
ing investigated by the Ber-
rien County Sheriff’s De-
partment and the Benton 
Township police.

The sheriff’s department 
reported that a 58-year-old 

resident of Alma Drive 
answered his door when 
he heard someone knock-
ing, and a man with a gun 
forced his way in while an-
other man appeared and 
also entered the house. The 
men threatened to kill the 
resident if  he did not give 
them money, which he did. 
The suspects left in a silver 
or light-colored mini van.

Anyone who has infor-
mation is asked to contact 
the sheriff’s department de-
tective bureau at 983-7141.
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COTTER LaSATA
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